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2018 ELEMENTARY SUMMER CAMP CATALOG 

Grade Level Camp Description 

K-2 
3-6 

 
 

Amazing Adventures 

 

***NEW LESSONS FOR 2018!!!*** 
Attention All Amazing Kids! We are 

going to take you on an adventure. We 
will fill your days with submarines, a 
gold rush, time machines and many 
more amazing activities.  Don’t miss 

out on our daily challenges!  Not only 
will you have an amazing time, but you 

will sharpen your reasoning skills, 
increase processing speed, and 

broaden your creative mind.   

K only 
1st only 
2nd only 
3rd only 
4th only 
5th only 

AUGUST CAMP ONLY  

Back to School Tune Up 
 

 

***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 
Pack your backpack because we are 

heading to school!  Get a jump start on 
the school year.  We will cover the 

skills necessary for a solid educational 
foundation and a smooth transition 

back to school.   

K-2 
3-6 

Builders 
 

 

***NEW LESSONS FOR 2018!!!*** 
Calling all inventors, creators, builders 

and designers! Come build some 
awesome creations with us!  We will 

create our own designs and make 
structures using recyclable materials, 

Legos and many other interesting 
items.   

Skills necessary… none!  
Skills gained: communication, problem 

solving, reasoning, developing 
creativity, and team work. 

K-6 
K-2 
3-6 

$25 SUPPLY FEE 

Delicious Designs 

 

***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 
What happens when art and food 

collide?  Come find out in our new D-I-
Y camp that will excite artsy campers 

who love to create and make!  Campers 
will construct masterpieces using 
traditional art materials as well as 

items usually designed for snacking.  
Find your inner artist and nibble a little 

along the way!   
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K-6 
K-2 
3-6 

$25 SUPPLY FEE 
BEST SELLER! 

Design The Runway 

 

Design your very own fashion line with 
us!  Budding designers will create a 

fashion portfolio, create a one of a kind 
piece with recyclable goods and end 

the week with a Runway Show to stop 
Fashion Week!  We will participate in 
several design challenges too.  Come 

design the runway with us! 
 

K-2 
 
 
 
 

Dinosaur Discovery 

 

Take an adventure back to the Jurassic 
Era where we will learn about 

dinosaurs who roamed the Earth 
millions of years ago.  Uncover 

fascinating facts, build a dinosaur 
replica and have an archaeological dig 

as you explore your paleontological 
skills.  In Dinosaur Discovery, you will 

become a paleontologist faster than 
Ornithomimids running from a T-Rex!  

 
K-6 
K-2 
3-6 

$25 SUPPLY FEE 
 

 
 

 
From Garden to Spoon 

 

 
 

 
***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 

Let’s get our hands dirty as we learn 
about gardening and food!  Garden 

with us by making take home garden 
boxes with a variety of herbs and other 

accessories for your garden.  Create 
some daily delicious treats with 

healthy foods!  Toss in our special 
ingredient of nature based crafts and 
you have from garden to spoon camp!  

 
 

3-6 
4th OF JULY WEEK 

ONLY! 
 
 

 
National Treasure Hunt 

 

 

 
***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 

Celebrate Independence Day with the 
ultimate treasure hunt. Unravel 

mysteries, crack clues, and decode 
cyphers to unlock the secrets to our 

nation’s history. Learn to solve a 
variety of complex coded puzzles as 

you delve deep into the symbols of our 
past. Who will be the first to claim the 

treasure? 
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K  

1-2 
3-4 
5-6 

 
 
 
 

 
Number Crunchers  

 

 

 
Have you ever been in a mental math 

game?  Do you like to roll the dice?  Do 
you have the edge to tackle 

mathematical concepts?  Join us as we 
explore math in an all new way! We 
will enrich your math skills through 

math fact games, problem solving 
competitions, logical reasoning and 
spatial math concept tournaments.  

Who knew math could be so much fun! 
 

 
K-2 
3-6 

BEST SELLER! 
 
 

 
Science Exploratorium 

 

 
 

 
Come discover, experiment, and create 
as we learn about the colliding worlds 
of art and science in this STEAM-based 

camp.  We will create biomes from 
around the world, star gaze at 

constellations, master meteorology, 
investigate how things work and 

dabble in chemistry and physics.  Put 
on your learning cap and grab the art 

supplies because this STEAM camp will 
rock your world.   

 
 

3-6 
BEST SELLER! 

Super Sleuths 
 

 
 
 
 
 

Get out your magnifying glasses and 
detective hat as we have clues to 

decipher and crimes to solve. We’ll put 
our critical thinking skills and STEM 
knowledge to the test and get to the 
bottom of mysteries by learning the 
tricks real investigators use to solve 

cases. While experimenting with 
simple detection techniques, your 

reasoning skills will grow and your 
problem solving skills will become 

better than CSI agents.  
 

K-6 
 
 
 

Olympic Madness 
 

 
 

***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 
Go for the gold!  Carry the Olympic 

torch to summer camp where you will 
participate in individual competitions 
and team based challenges for a week 
of fun and games. Olympic Madness is 
for all those campers who want to try 

new sports and take your physical 
abilities to a whole new level.   

http://www.google.com/imgres?hl=en&biw=1366&bih=643&tbm=isch&tbnid=lsY8DFIZ4twbDM:&imgrefurl=http://www.mycutegraphics.com/graphics/science/kids-in-science-class.html&docid=HoNub9CY5_BGhM&imgurl=http://content.mycutegraphics.com/graphics/science/kids-in-science-class.png&w=550&h=498&ei=drRAUYWtApD-8ATq94C4DQ&zoom=1&ved=1t:3588,r:43,s:0,i:218&iact=rc&dur=435&page=2&tbnh=177&tbnw=195&start=21&ndsp=29&tx=109&ty=53
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K-6 
 
 
 

Out of this World Mania 
 

 

***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 
5, 4, 3, 2, 1 blast off to a galaxy far, far 

away to learn about Earth and the 
amazing solar system.  Discover all 

things galactic such as comets, planets, 
shooting stars, rockets and more. Learn 

about flight, the adventures of space 
travel, and participate in a rocket 

launch! 
 

K-2 
3-6 

BEST SELLER! 

Whiz Kids  
 

 

***NEW LESSONS FOR 2018!!!*** 
Join us on a science discovery mission!  

We will explore the world of science 
through everyday objects, experiments 

and encounters.  This camp will 
enhance the STEM education 

philosophies with a big punch of fun.  
Physics, biology, chemistry, geology, 

astronomy and zoology will all be 
covered in the camp. 

 
K-2 
3-6 

 
 
 

World of Wizards 

 

***NEW CAMP FOR 2018!!!*** 
Calling all wizard fans!  This is like no 
other camp you have experienced. We 

will take a magical journey into the 
world of wizards.  We will design 

wands, make magic potions, go on a 
magical creature hunt, play Quidditch, 
and participate in activities that will 

astound all Muggles. 
 

2-6 
BEST SELLER! 

Writer’s Mashup 

 

Test your linguistic prowess and get 
your creative writing juices flowing in 

Writer’s Mashup.  We will entertain 
each other with comic designs, Magna 

Comic writing, and skit creations as 
well as language games to get even 

weary writers gunning to write more 
and more.  Authors will build a 

portfolio of work as well as design a 
book. 

 
 

Camps can be either full or half day with a minimum of five children.   

ANY OF OUR SUMMER CAMPS (OR A COMBINATION OF CAMPS) CAN BE USED FOR 

HOLIDAY OR SCHOOL BREAK CAMPS! 

http://www.google.com/imgres?hl=en&biw=1366&bih=643&tbm=isch&tbnid=lsY8DFIZ4twbDM:&imgrefurl=http://www.mycutegraphics.com/graphics/science/kids-in-science-class.html&docid=HoNub9CY5_BGhM&imgurl=http://content.mycutegraphics.com/graphics/science/kids-in-science-class.png&w=550&h=498&ei=drRAUYWtApD-8ATq94C4DQ&zoom=1&ved=1t:3588,r:43,s:0,i:218&iact=rc&dur=435&page=2&tbnh=177&tbnw=195&start=21&ndsp=29&tx=109&ty=53

